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Inter-Departmental Memorandum

03/27/2026 *
CENTRAL OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT .

Esshaki / Henry

DATE: March 18, 2026
To: Gary Piotrowicz, P.E., PTOE, Deputy Managing Director
FrROM: Mary N. Gillis, P.E., Director, Central Operations Department W

SuBJECT: FY 2026 CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, BANDS, AND BOLTS -
IFB NO.7924

Background:

The RCOC Highway Maintenance Department utilizes corrugated metal pipes to maintain
stormwater flow in ditches and beneath roads and driveways. These materials are
maintained as inventory and delivered directly to each maintenance district by the vendor.
Annual quantity requirements are estimated by the Highway Maintenance Department.

Bids were published February 20, 2026, and opened on March 10, 2026. Bids were
solicited from several suppliers with two bids received.

Financial Considerations:

The low bid meeting specifications was received from Cadillac Culvert Inc. in the amount
of $18,714.41. Cadillac Culvert Inc. has previously supplied materials to the Road
Commission with satisfactory performance.

The price and percentage comparison table is available on page three. Price increases
within the industry are typical.

Recommendation:

It is recommended that the Board award the bid to the low bidder meeting specifications
from Cadillac Culvert Inc., in the amount of $18,714.41, and reject all other bids.
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Inter-Departmental Memorandum
Highway Maintenance

DATE: March 17, 2026

To: Mary Gillis, P.E., Director of Central Operations
FrROMm: Jay Carter, P.E., Maintenance Operations Engineer

SUBJECT: BID RECOMMENDATION FOR FY 2026 CORRUGATED METAL PIPE,
BANDS, AND BOLTS - IFB NO. 7924

Bids were received for the annual requirements of Corrugated Metal Pipe, Bands, and
Bolts to be delivered to the various Maintenance district garages as required. The
Highway Maintenance Department will utilize its Other Road Materials account for these
materials.

The low bidder meeting specifications is Cadillac Culvert Inc. with a total bid price of
$18,714.41. Cadillac Culvert Inc. has provided products to the Road Commission in the
past with favorable results.

| recommend the Board accept the bid from Cadillac Culvert Inc.

Please see attached pricing comparison by year.
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CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, BANDS, AND BOLTS - IFB NO. 7924

Description

2025 Price

2026 Price

+/- Percentage

3500106

BAND METAL 12"

CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA

MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12"" WIDTH

13.86

16.84

21.50%

3500205

BAND METAL 18"

CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA

MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH

21.40

20.11

-6.03%

3500213
BAND PLASTIC 18"
SINGLE WALL

No Bid

No Bid

3500255

BAND METAL 24"

CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA

"MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" "WIDTH"

No Bid

28.24

3500354

BAND METAL 36" 14 GA

CRRGTD METAL,FORMED BOTTOM
MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH

No Bid

55.00

3500453

BAND CMP 21X15 (18"),14 GA
CRRGTD METAL,FORMED BOTTOM
MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH

23.55

20.90

-11.25%

3500700

BAND METAL 24" FOR CMP 28X20
CRRGTD FORMED BOTTOM, 14 GA
MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH

31.36

29.62

-5.55%

3502003
PIPE CMP 12" X 24'
CORRUGATED METAL,14 GA

8.40

9.20

9.52%

3502053
PIPE CMP 15" X 24'
CORRUGATED METAL,14 GA

10.65

11.29

6.01%

3502102
PIPE CMP 18" X 24'
CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA

12.96

13.55

4.55%

3502152
PIPE CMP 24" X 24'
CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA

No Bid

18.95

3502558
PIPE CMP 17X13 X 24' (15")
CRRGTD, FORMED BOTTOM, 14 GA

11.72

11.85

1.11%

3502607
PIPE CMP 21X15X 24 "' (18")
CRRGTD, FORMED BOTTOM, 14 GA

14.26

14.15

-0.77%
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Road Commission for Oakland County
7924 - CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, BANDS, AND BOLTS
March 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Cadillac Culvert Inc. ST REGIS CULVERT, INC
5305 M-115 202 Morrell St
Cadillac, MI 49601 Charlotte, MI 48813

Is there an objection or deviation? No Yes
Specify: All arched bands will be universal
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing? 90 days 30 days from bid date
Minimum order requirements. NA Delivery included for all quantities bid
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order: 7-21 35
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30 Yes Yes
If so, state discount 1% 10 Net 30 1% Net 10

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded |Yes Yes

Manufacturer Price Total Cost Vendor Comment Manufacturer Part # Total Cost Vendor Comment

3500106
BAND METAL 12"
CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA CADILLAC CULVERT
MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH 11 Each INC ABAND12G12 S 16.84 | S 185.24 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. S 18.56 | S 204.16
3500205
BAND METAL 18"
CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA CADILLAC CULVERT
MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH 7 Each INC ABAND18G24 20.11 140.77 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 28.25 197.75
3500213
BAND PLASTIC 18"
SINGLE WALL 5 Each No Bid No Bid
3500255

BAND METAL 24"
CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA
“MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH " 8 Each Cadilla Culvert Inc. |ABAND24G12 28.24 225.92 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 45.60 364.80
3500354

BAND METAL 36" 14 GA
CORRUGATED METAL
"MINIMUM WIDTH 12" " 2 Each Cadilla Culvert Inc. |ABAND36G12 55.00 110.00 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 68.40 136.80
3500453

BAND CMP 21X15 (18"),14 GA
CRRGTD METAL,FORMED BOTTOM
MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12" WIDTH 2 Each Cadilla Culvert Inc. |ABAND2115G12 20.90 459.80 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 28.25 621.50 |Universal Band
3500700

BAND METAL 24" FOR CMP 28X20
CRRGTD FORMED BOTTOM, 14 GA

"MUST HAVE A MINIMUM 12"" WIDTH " 2 Each Cadilla Culvert Inc. |ABAND2820G12 29.62 59.24 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 45.60 91.20 |Universal Band

3502003

PIPE CMP 12" X 24'

CORRUGATED METAL,14 GA 336 Foot/Feet Cadilla Culvert Inc. |1214G24 9.20 3,091.20 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 11.25 3,780.00

3502053

PIPE CMP 15" X 24'

CORRUGATED METAL,14 GA 96 Foot/Feet Cadilla Culvert Inc. |1514G24 11.29 1,083.84 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 14.10 1,353.60

3502102

PIPE CMP 18" X 24'

CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA 144 Foot/Feet Cadilla Culvert Inc. |184G24 13.55 1,951.20 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 17.10 2,462.40

3502152

PIPE CMP 24" X 24'

CORRUGATED METAL, 14 GA 216 Foot/Feet Cadilla Culvert Inc. |2414G24 18.95 4,093.20 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 22.80 4,924.80

3502558

PIPE CMP 17X13 X 24' (15")

CRRGTD, FORMED BOTTOM, 14 GA 216 Foot/Feet Cadilla Culvert Inc. |ARCH171316G24 11.85 2,559.60 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 15.50 3,348.00

3502607

PIPE CMP 21X15X 24 ' (18")

CRRGTD, FORMED BOTTOM, 14 GA 336 Foot/Feet Cadilla Culvert Inc. |ARCH211516G24 14.15 4,754.40 St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 18.81 6,320.16
TOTALS: $ 18,714.41 $ 23,805.17

IFB NO.7924 - Bids.xlsx
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